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Transcripts

Unit 1 Too Small!

G I want a new sweater. 

B Why? Is yours too small? 

G No. 

B Does it have a hole in it? 

G No. I just want a different one.

B Oh, OK. I need new shoes. My
shoes are too small. 

G Let’s go shopping!

B OK. My dad can take us today.

G: Great! 

Unit 2 Too Much Glue!

B What are you doing? 

G I’m making a paper doll. I’m 
cutting out her shoes now. 

B Oh. Why do you have string? 

G It’s for her hair. Do you want to help? 

B Sure. 

G OK. You can do her hair. Glue the
string to her head. 

B Like this? 

G Uh, oh! That’s too much! She has
too much hair! 

Unit 3 Ice Cream

B I’m hungry, Meg. Let’s get some ice
cream!

G Good idea, Tom!

B My favorite flavor is chocolate. 
Do you like chocolate ice cream?

G No, I like strawberry ice cream.

B Really? I don’t like that flavor. 

G It’s yummy! I like strawberry ice
cream in a cone. How about you?

B I like chocolate ice cream in a dish
with cherries on top. 

G I’m so hungry! Let’s get some ice
cream now.

Unit 4 A Pinata

B This is a great party!

G Thanks! Do you like the piñata? It is
made for special holidays in
Mexico.

B Oh! It’s made from paper. It’s nice!

G It’s filled with candy and toys! You
hit the piñata with a stick and
break it open. Then you can have
the candy and toys!

B I can do it! Give me a stick!

G It’s not easy! Your eyes are 
covered!

B Let’s hit the piñata together!

Unit 5 He’s Late!

B Oh, no! I’m ten minutes late! 

G What are you late for?

B Dinner! I don’t want to keep 
everyone waiting.

G You can take my bike.

B Thanks! I can pedal really fast on
your bike.

G Wait! Here is your backpack.

B Oh! Thanks!

G See you later!
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Unit 6 A Big Bird

B What are you doing?

G I’m watching TV. I’m learning about
different animals.

B What is that? It looks strange!

G It’s an ostrich. Ostriches are the
largest living birds.

B Wow! Now what’s that? 

G That’s the smallest living bird. 

B It’s very small!

G Yes, and its wings move very fast!

Unit 7 Making a Snowman

G I made a big snowman last year.

B How big was it?

G The body was taller than I was. 

B Wow! How did you make a 
snowman that big?

G My dad helped me. He can roll
large snowballs.

B I like to use a carrot for the 
snowman’s nose.

G Me, too. But my dad eats the 
carrot!

B That’s OK. You can get another one.

Unit 8 Sunflowers

B Those are pretty flowers.

G Thanks! I picked them today.

B They’re very tall!

G Yes! They’re sunflowers. They’re
my favorite flowers.

B Why are they your favorite? Do you
like the color?

G Yes, but I really like the seeds. You
can eat them! 

B I didn’t know that.

G Here, try one.

B Wow! They’re really tasty!

Unit 9 A Bumpy Ride

G Where did everyone go?

B They’re over there eating 
watermelon at the table.

G Oh. I’m not hungry. Do you want to
play basketball?

B Sure, where’s the ball?

G I don’t see it.

B I see it under the tree. Here, catch
the ball!

G Oh, no! The ball bounced and hit
the table! Now, the watermelon is
everywhere!

B Uh, oh! They don’t look happy.

Unit 10 A Caterpillar Nap

G Hey, wake up!

B Why? 

G Sorry, but there is a caterpillar
crawling on your arm! 

B That's OK. I like caterpillars. 

G Caterpillars are nice, but I love the
beauty of butterflies. 

B Look! There’s a butterfly in the
flowers. It’s a pretty color!

G Do you want to look for more 
butterflies? 

B No, thanks. It’s time for another nap.

G OK. Have a good sleep.
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Transcripts

Unit 11 Tongue Twisters

G These words are hard to say.

B Yes, but we have to learn this new
song for music class.

G This song is like a tongue twister.
The sounds are the same!

B It’s not as hard as you think.

G OK. Let’s sing it together. 

B Sure! Let’s make the song more
fun, too.

G Good idea! 

Unit 12 When I Grow Up

B What do you want to be when you
grow up, Claire?

G I want to be an artist. I like to draw
and paint.

B Oh, yes! You can draw good 
pictures!

G What do you want to be, Dave?

B I’m not sure. I love soccer, so I
want to be a soccer player. But, I
want to be a doctor, too.

G You do love soccer! You would be a
great soccer player.

B Yes. I think so, too. 

Unit 13 Dubai

B I want to go to Dubai.

G Really? What can you do there?

B Well, there’s great shopping. And
you can take trips to the desert.

G Wow! What other exciting things
can you do?

B I want to see the tallest hotel in the
world!

G That sounds fun!

B Oh! And I also want to ride a camel
in the desert!

G I want to go to Dubai, too!

Unit 14 Bubbles!

W What are you doing? 

B I’m doing my laundry. Can you help
me?

W Well, OK. It’s really easy to do.

B I’m not sure how to use the 
washing machine.

W Put the clothes in the machine with
some soap. 

B How much soap do I need to use?

W Not too much. You don’t want 
bubbles in the air.

B OK, Mom. Thanks for your help.

Unit 15 Dinosaurs

B Where did you go today?

G I went to the museum.

B Wow! That’s exciting! I love the
museum.

G Yes! I learned a lot about dinosaurs.
My favorite dinosaur was very big!

B Some dinosaurs were really small,
too.

G Yeah, some were as small as chickens. 

B Did any dinosaurs live here?

G Sure! A long time ago, they lived all
over the world.
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Unit 16 The Loose Tooth

G Why are your fingers in your mouth?

B My tooth is loose. I want it to come
out!

G Don’t pull on it! Wait for it to fall out.

B But it won’t fall out! 

G Yes, it will. Just move it back and forth.

B Then will it come out?

G Yes, I think so. 

B OK, thanks.

Unit 17 Just Like Dave

B What are you eating?

G I’m eating vegetables. Do you want
some?

B No thanks. I want to watch this
movie.

G It looks scary.

B There’s only a monster in it. Oh!
Wait! What do I hear?

G That’s my brother. He likes to sing.

B I do, too. Let’s go sing with your
brother!

Unit 18 The Longest River

G Do you want to travel?

B Yes, I want to travel to Africa one day.

G That’s exciting! Why do you want to
go to Africa?

B I want to see the Nile River.

G Oh, why?

B Well, it’s the longest river in the
world. It flows through the desert,
too.

G Hmm, that’s strange. What desert?

B The Sahara desert.

G Oh! That is one of the largest
deserts in the world!

Unit 19 Playing in the Sand

B Can we go to the beach today?

G Sure, if it doesn’t rain.

B The beach is my favorite place to
go.

G Yes, I love making sandcastles in
the sand.

B Let’s make a big sandcastle today.

G OK. Will we have time to finish it?

B Sure, we will. I’ll get the flag from
the sandbox to put on it.

G Good idea!

Unit 20 Hello and Good-bye

G Do you bow to your grandparents?

B No, but I hug them.

G I think they bow in China.

B I think so, too. Everywhere is 
different.

G Yes, there are many ways to say
hello and good-bye.

B I like to wave to say hello and hug
to say good-bye.

G Me too! Well, I have to go home.
See you soon!

B OK. Good-bye!




